
EMPOWERING MY VISION: A GLOBAL MBA IN 
GERMANY AS A CATALYST FOR LEADERSHIP AND 

INNOVATION. 

As I stand ready to start a new journey toward the next chapter of my academic and professional life, 

my heart is full of excitement and determination to pursue a Global MBA at Berlin School of Business 

and Innovation (BSBI). Germany, with its top-notch academic toughness, cutting-edge innovation, 

and strong economy, rests as the best incubator for a future class of business leaders to work and 

shine bright in the ever-challenging world of business. This explains why I am so motivated about 

Germany and BSBI, what tremendous benefits I expect out of this experience, and how it fulfils my 

dreams for a bright future once the program is over. 

Why Germany? Germany has always been the world leader in innovation and development, not only 
in Europe but globally. The country is very famous for its excellent education system, which equips 
students with a state-of-the-art theoretical base and practical hands-on application. In Germany, 
specifically focusing on research-based and industry-oriented education, students find opportunities 
to be within reach of real-world problems by working together with some of the smartest brains in the 
world. 

This fully meets my aspirations to acquire broad knowledge about the way business is handled at the 
global level, while at the same time sharpening leadership and entrepreneurial skills. With the 
academic quotient in place, Germany is the centre of Europe, a country with a bustling economy and 
home to an important point of contact for all those who wish to enter into the global business arena. 
As one of the world's largest economies, Germany boasts an extensive array of multinationals and 
groundbreaking startups, not to forget the pulsating innovation ecosystem in the country. This vibrant 
business environment provides access to industry networks, internships, and collaborative 
experiences of excellent quality that would certainly add value to my journey. Here, what really makes 
cultural diversity and inclusiveness in Germany special is its welcoming nature and dynamic 
environment for international students. Known for its openness and embrace of people from all walks 
of life, it is a once-in-a-lifetime opportunity for personal growth. I am eager to immerse myself in the 
historical and cultural wealth of Germany as I engage with people coming from various backgrounds. 

This cultural exposure will not only enrich my academic pursuit but also help me attain a broader 
global perspective to navigate through the complexities of an interconnected world. 

The Berlin School of Business and Innovation (BSBI) is a school dedicated to developing the future 
generation of leaders in global business. The Global MBA from BSBI is related to my career aspiration, 
as it involves a comprehensive curriculum covering all the key aspects of international business, 
leadership, entrepreneurship, and strategic management. This, together with the practical, real-
world case study approach of the program, lays emphasis on emerging global business trends and 
ensures that I get the skills and knowledge necessary to cope with dynamic challenges in business. 



Berlin, the city that will host my studies, further enhances the appeal of BSBI. A global nexus for 
entrepreneurship, creativity, and innovation, it offers an epicentre of opportunities for career 
advancement and networking. The vibrant startup culture is laced with a student-friendly 
environment that aids in making the most out of such rich experiences beyond what is merely 
transacted inside the classroom. Besides, BSBI has a mission to create an environment for 
multicultural learning that goes well with my personal wish to come into interaction with the culturally 
diversified professional community. Working with peers across the globe will not only help me bring 
diversity to my perspectives but also lead to innovative changes in the environment for teaching and 
learning. Moreover, for successful development in the long run in the international business arena, 
these global alumni connections of BSBI and strong relationships with industries worldwide will 
provide those basic necessary professional contacts. 

There is great influence my undergraduate academic and work experience had on me making the 
decision to be part of a Global MBA. I acquired a sound footing in all those areas critical to business: 
Entrepreneurship, Human Resource, and Strategic Management, among many other subjects 
pertinent to business management. Subjects like these make me wonder how businesses really 
function on the inside and how strategic decisions can actually create success. Professionally, I have 
gathered rich experience in business development, software testing, and operations, which assisted 
me in understanding the operational aspects of managing a business while working on improving my 
analysis and problem-solving abilities. But I also fully understand that relentless learning is the only 
way towards winning the present-day competitive world business scenario. A Global MBA would 
definitely leverage and broaden my existing knowledge, building the leadership and managerial 
competencies required to meet the dynamic markets all over the globe. 

I hope to return to India after my Global MBA at BSBI and use all the skills and knowledge acquired to 
contribute to the growth and development in the country. The economy grows rapidly, and there are 
massive entrepreneurial opportunities associated with innovation and sustainable development in 
the country. I am very much in love with how to deal with issues concerning economic inequality and 
environmental sustainability. I believe my education shall then help me to devise impactful solutions 
within these very areas. In the long run, I aspire to establish my own business or to work with 
organizations in a leadership position that has a social impact. I want to be able to use global 
perspectives, which I will acquire from my studies here in Germany, to drive innovations and kick-
start more ethical business practices and an inclusive growth culture in my community and beyond. 

I have chosen to pursue an MBA Global at Berlin School of Business and Innovation in Germany out 
of deep commitment for personal and professional growth. In Germany, a strong academic standard 
and dynamic business landscape are obtained with full inclusivity in the cultural environment, 
underpinning my ability to reach what I aspire to do. It is my firm belief that this life-transforming 
experience will give me the skills and perspectives necessary to create a difference in the global 
business community and, in the last analysis, in the accomplishment of positive social change. I 
believe that the Immigration Officer, after considering my application, will see how excited I am to be 
in Germany for higher studies and will realize how contributory I will eventually become from both the 
academics as well as professional perspectives. I am more than ready to accept every challenge and 
opportunity that comes my way, realizing that time spent in Germany is a rung in the ladder that is to 
play an instrumental role in the fulfilment of my aspirations. 


